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Emma Dane

— —
From: Claire B <bas.reception@gmail.com>
Sent: 29 April 2016 13:24
To: Emma Dane; Glenn Brooks
Cc: Philip Nickson
Subject: Re: Martin Sir Invoices - Payment Direct

Now that was annoying - | hit send before I finished the email!
Here are the bank details

IBAN CZ67 0300 0000 0002 5162 7940

SWIFT CEKOCZPP

On Fri, Apr 29, 2016 at 1:19 PM, Claire B <bas.reception(@gmail.com> wrote:
Emma

Further to recent conversations please find attached the invoices to be paid directly to Martin Sir. If you
will note the invoices are made out to GB Pension so there should be no issues there

The bank details are as follows and I trust that all is now in order for you to remit these funds to Mr Sir

directly. The payment is an International hence the IBAN and Swift but this should be sufficient for you to
make the transfer in my experience. Please do let me know if any more is needed however.

IBAN CZ67

I would be grateful for confirmation of when this has been done so we can contact Mr Sir to advise
My thanks for your co-operation

Regards

Claire Barrett

Director

Barrett Accounting Services

10 Locks Lane, The Common, Purton, Wiltshire SN5 4HD

Tel/Fax: 01793 771008 Mob: 07712 669090

This e-mail message (including any attachments) is from Barrett Accounting Services (a division of Barrett
& Barrett Professional Services Ltd) and intended for the addressee only. It may contain information that is
privileged and confidential.If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or take any

action in reliance of it.If this communication has been sent to you in error, please notify us immediately by
1
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Krakonosova 1003 DIC: CZ7308262577
480 14 Liberec
Ceska republika e-mail: martin.sir73@seznam.cz
Faktura - dafiovy doklad 20160007
Odbératel
GB CONTRACTS PENSION SCHEME
CHELWORTH IND. ESTATE BRAYDON LANE CRICKLADE
WILTS
SN66HQ ENGLAND
Spojené kralovstv(
1C: 3689012
DIC: GB724353546
Datum Symbol
vystaveni: 09.03,2016 konstantni: 0308 Platba; Pfevodem
splatnosti: 23.03.2016 variablini: 20160007 Cislo objedndvky:
DUZP: 09.03.2016
Bankovni ucet Kéd banky
251627940 0300
IBAN: CZ67 0300 0000 0002 5162 SWIFT: CEKOCZPP
7940
Fakturujeme Vam za dodané zboZI & sluzby:
Oznateni dodaviy Pofet m.j. Cenazamj. DPH % Bez DPH DPH S DPH
Description- Labour Charges-Plot G, Lakeside Business 1,0000 4 901,0000 [i] 4 901,00 0,00 4 901,00
Park for the month of February
Zéklad Vy$e DPH Celkem
Kurz faktury
Nulova sazba 35,06 0,00 35,06
mnoZstvi: 4901,0000
kurz: 35,0560 CELKEM 35,06 0,00 35,06

Pozn.: Castky jsou vietné hadnot zackrouhlen]

Celkem k Ghradé:

MARTINSIR

P

Frosim, ubradto Chstid 4 901,00 GBF na Gtet 251627340/0300 s variabiini ¥ 1 20160007 a K 8y 0308

Podnikatel je zapsan v Zivnostenském rejstiiku

4 901,00 GBP

AL L A cend g 1KY




Martin Sir

Krakono$ava 1003
460 14 Liberec
Ceska republika

LE [T

e-mail: martin.sir73@seznam,cz

Faktura - dafiovy doklad

20150077

Odbératel

GB CONTRACTS PENSION SCHEME
CHELWORTH IND. ESTATE BRAYDON LANE CRICKLADE

WILTS
SN66HQ ENGLAND
Spojené kralovstvl
IC: 3689012
DIC: GB724353546
Datum Symbol
vystaveni: 16,12.2015 konstantni: 0308 Platba: Pfevodem
splatnosti: 30.12.2015 variablini: 20150077 Cislo objednsvky:
DUZP: 16.12.2015
Bankovni uéet Kod banky
| 251627940 | [ 0300 |
IBAN: CZ6703000000000251627940  SWIFT: CEKOCZPP
Fakturujeme Vam za dodané zbo{ & sluby:
Oznadeni dodavky Potet m.§. Cenazam,j. DPH % Bez DPH DPH SDPH
Description- Labour Charges-Plot G, Lakeside Business 1,0000 5771,0000 [+ 5771,00 0,00 5771,00
Park for the month of December
Ziklad Vyse DPH Celkem
Kurz faktury
CELKEM 0,00 0,00 0,00
mnoZstvi: 1,0000
Kurz: 0,0000 Pozn.; Castky jsou vEetnd hodnot zaokroutdent
Celkem k Ghradé: 5771,00 GBP
MARTIN-§1R
LA e YT R R0
L AL I gF %
Taaria il Glali
Prosim, uhradte ¢éstka 5 771.00 GBP na déet 251627940/0300 s vapah ymbolem 0150077 a kor im symbolem 0308

Podnlkate] ju zapsan v Zvnoslenském rejsifiku



From: Glenn Brooks glenn.brooks @holmail.co.uk
Subject: No Subject
Date: Yeslerday at 19:02
To: glenn.brooks@holmail.co.uk

Martin &ir

Mraransdionag 1002
34D 98 by

frall) RIWTITA
DI L2 gt

CuskA e pudlh oAk et 0 et AELRL AL
Faktura - danovy doklad 20160008 I
Qdberate! .
GB CONTRACTS PENSION BCHEME
EHEL{:’MRTH MO ESTATE BAAYDUN LANE CRICKLATE
VALY
SHESHA ENBLAND
Spojere kalman: e
IC: a8abiz
BIC: ZETIAIERI40G
Duaturs Symbiol
svhliwn . 2003 2012 bt €304 Plaba. Presodin
aplatnash: 31042018 irlabilul. 20140003 Lisln ohjimegvky.
DUZF. 2203 2015
Bankirers ukil K&y bk
251627940 0300 |
IBAN, g‘éﬁl’ €303 0027 AX02 FiEd SWAFT . CERCLC PP
[
Faelqnrm am 2040006 20ad fish iy
Conadurs Sodiuky Potet m.3 Consss .. DPH Bz DR ] X DFt
Denz-glexts Ladsaas Llactay Phal g Ladinate B tian P T 1280 s Ir E P 2S804 b 4 dmLe
Pas 4 ims nctdlioof Pae=
Zihlad Wyde OPH Celkivey
Koz 134100, e S W S A W Sy SOk PR Sl Hamiasin S
Hulowd sarba 112455 50 oo 112 854,50
[ EHH 0N 1 CCny
a2, 381390 CELKEM 11245550 bou 112 8.’3‘!.5&

TR VR OVE AP S OF S ey

Celkem k uahrads; 3 250,00 GBP
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