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Stacy Lunnon <stacyl@pensionpractitioner.com>

Fwd: MCH Directors Holding Pension

Brad Davis <bradd@pensionpractitioner.com> 21 December 2016 at 19:57
To: Georgina Stuliglowa <georginas@pensionpractitioner.com>, Stacy Lunnon <stacyl@pensionpractitioner.com>

FYI

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Nick Parry <Nick@manorcarhire.co.uk>

Date: 21 December 2016 at 18:14

Subject: Re: MCH Directors Holding Pension

To: "Brad Davis (bradd@pensionpractitioner.com)" <bradd@pensionpractitioner.com>, Gavin
<gavinm@pensionpractitioner.com>

Cc: Richard Penn <Richard.Penn@mitchellcharlesworth.co.uk>, "karen parry (kparry72@hotmail.com)”
<kparry72@hotmail.com>

Good afternoon Brad/Gavin, hope your well and ready for Christmas?

I've detailed below as trustee of the pension scheme how these we’re allocated.

Nick
Karen

2009/10
£350.000

£245.000 — Personal Input Period end 01/03/2010
£105.000 — Persona Input Period end 01/03/2011

2010/2011
2010/2011

£255,000

£150,000 — Personal Input Period end — 01/03/2011 £49,700 —
Personal Input Period 01/03/2012

£50,000 — Personal Input Period end — 01/03/2012

2011/2012

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?71i=2&ik=009a9b3b96 & view=pt&search=inbox&m... 09/01/2017



PensionPractitioner.com Mail - Fwd: MCH Directors Holding Pension Page 2 of 3

£200.000

£50,000 Personal Payment Input Period ending — 01/03/2013 £48,800 —
Personal Input Period Ending — 01/03/2013

201213

£50,000 — Personal Input Period ending — 01/03/14 £48,800 —
Personal Input Period ending — 01/03/14

2013/14

£50.000 — Persona Input Period Ending — 01/03/2015 £48,800 —
Personal Input Period Ending — 01/03/15

2014/15

£40,000 — Personal Input Period ending — 09/07/15 £39,700 —
Personal Input Period ending — 09/07/15

2015/16

£40,000 — Personal Input Period ending — 05/04/16 £39.200 —
Personal Input period ending — 05/04/16

| believe that you will calculate the life time allowance forecast for me and Karen, if you could be kind enough to confirm as soon
as possible I'd be most appreciative.

All the best and have a great Christmas and New Year

Nick Parry

Director

4 PcM

By

In partnership with the PFA - www.givemefootball.com

Tel: 08448 911 911
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D-Dial: 01925 467 332
Fax: 01925719 610

www.manorcarhire.co.uk

Our fleet of vehicles are not exempt from toll/congestion charges.

The hirer is responsible for all respective toll and congestion charge zones. This also includes the Dartford Crossing between
6am and 10pm. There is no longer a facility to pay at the barriers when using the Dartford Crossing.

You must pay by midnight on the day after you cross. The payment service is called Dart Charge, using the following link
https://www.gov.uk/pay-dartford-crossing-charge

Pension Practitioner.com
Daws House

33-35 Daws Lane
London

NW?7 4SD

T: 0800 634 4862
F: 020 8711 2522

UK Reg Co No: 6028668

VAT Reg No: 894312018
HMRC Practitioner Reg: 00005886
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