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Account Holder Reference 00007400000000JAM300 . Bank Balance 17,286.36
Account Holder Name JAM 300 L Ledger Balance 17,286.36
Account Number VIR11223320012274 L Forward Balance 17,286.36
Account Type €G- Chentg _ _ Available Balance _ . 17,286.36
Account Currency GBP - Sterling ) Balance Brought Forward i 0.00

Transactions | Forward grStatements “ Interest

1tolofil

Settled Date [Transaction Date Transaction Reference Description Debit Credit) Running Balance

01/03/2018 01/03/2018 000224477A1 Metro Account Closure 17,286.36 17,286.36

17, 286.36 - Batance
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AIB BANKPLC
Sort Code: 23-83-96

Outward Payment Instruction for Faster Payments
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1. SCHEME DETAILS
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2. PAYMENT DETAILS

Date t0 be actioned

o [£17,786 36
s [Senenteen Thousands Tiwe Hundeed and. £k, Thee

L Pounds$ ana Thilhy six pence )
(3. BENEFICIARY B
e [ JAm 300 ]
ey (o) - W - o saveiey o (1) 2J{ONON A4 6JO)
| Pomonteen [ Jam 300 SsAs )

’

~

4. PURPOSE OF TRANSACTION - Description
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" | form in accordance with the following authorised account signatures. o

We authorise the scheme administrator to make the payment on the date stated on this
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Emma

e e == S S
From: Rhianna Noble <RNoble@tag.uk.com>

Sent: 05 March 2018 09:44

To: ‘Emma’

Subject: URGENT! JAM 300 SSAS

Attachments: 2018-01-10 10.08.29.pdf

Importance: High

Good morning Em,
DT wants to know when the clients can expect to receive the money into the below account please.
Yours sincerely

Rhianna Noble

Administrator

TAG Wealth Management

Riverdale, 89 Graham Road, Sheffield S10 3GP
Tel: 0114 263 0888

The information contained in this Email and any attached files may be confidential and is intended solely for the addressee. Copying, dissemination, distribution or re-use of
the information contained in this Email and any attached files by anyone else is unauthorised. Internet communications are not secure and therefore TAG Wealth
Management does not accept any legal responsibility for the contents of this message. Any views or opinions presented arethose of the-author and donot necessarily
represent those of TAG Wealth Management. If you are not the intended recipient, all copies of the Email and any associated files should be destroyed. TAG Wealth
Management cannot guarantee that this email remains virus free once sent.

TAG Wealth Management is an appointed representative of Intrinsic Financial Planning Ltd and Intrinsic Mortgage Planning Ltd, registered
in England 5372217, Wiltshire Court, Farnsby Street, Swindon, SN1 5AH. Intrinsic Financial Services is a holding company, subsidiaries of
which are authorised and regulated by the Financial Conduct Authority

Partners: D Thompson MLIBF DipFA & A R M Young MLIBF DipFA

% please don't print this email unless you really need to.

From: Peter Best [mailto:pbest@tag.uk.com]

Sent: 16 February 2018 10:12

To: 'Emma Dane' <emmad@pensionpractitioner.com>
Subject: URGENT!!!

Morning,

The office said you aren’t well and are working from home, hope its nothing serious and you feel better soon?

DT has been talking to Merle again this morning (what were we saying about not going around the system?) and
apparently she has agreed that this payment can now be made. Jam 300 have paid the invoice so the money now
em. The account details are:

Account No: 12007460
Sort Code: 404107

I’m not in the office again uftil Friday next week, so hope you have a nice weekend, and if you need anything can

yQu contact Rhianp
Yours sincerely

Peter Best pipPFs Cert CH (Life and Pensions)



