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Fwd: LUMON - Confirmation of funds paid

Georgina Martin <georginam@retirement.capital>

gehane habib <gehabib12@hotmail.com> Tue, May 14, 2024 at 2:08 PM
To: David Nicklin <georginam@retirement.capital>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: onlinebusiness@lumonpay.com

Date: 14 May 2024 at 12:42:57 BST

To: gehabib12@hotmail.com

Subject: LUMON - Confirmation of funds paid

Dear Gehane,

Please be advised that we have released GBP101,744.19 to GEHANE HABIB PENSION
FUND 39736519 for delivery on Tuesday, May 14, 2024.

Kind regards,

Lumon team

40 Holborn Viaduct
London

EC1N 2PB

Tel : +44 (0)20 3384 7280
Fax : +44 (0)20 3384 7288

online@lumonpay.com
www.lumonpay.com

Please
be aware that payments may be subject to fees charged by intermediary or
receiving banks, which are outside of our control.

Lumon Pay Ltd (“LPL”), trading as Lumon, is a company registered in England with its
registered address at 40 Holborn Viaduct, London, EC1N 2PB.

LPL is authorised by the Financial Conduct Authority as an Electronic Money Institution
(FRN: 902022).
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