A 4

Georgina Martin <georginam@retirement.capital>

Loan Repayments & Aib Bank Balance

gehane habib <gehabib12@hotmail.com> Tue, Aug 13, 2024 at 11:27 AM
To: Georgina Martin <georginam@retirement.capital>

Yes

No interest was paid for 23/24
Thanks

Gina

Sent from my iPhone

On 13 Aug 2024, at 10:20, Georgina Martin <georginam@retirement.capital> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]



